
Application for a premises licence
under the Gambling Act 2005 (standard form)

PLEASE READ THE FOLLOWING INSTRUCTIONS FIRST

lf you are completing this form by hand, please write legibly in block capitals using ink. Use
additional sheets if necessary (marked with the number of the relevant question).-You may wish to
keep a copy of the completed form for your records.

Where the application is-
. ln respect of a vessel, or
. To convert an authorisation granted underthe Betting, Gaming and Lotteries Act 1g63 or

the Gaming Act 1968,

the a lication should be made on the relevant form for that of tses or lication

Do you hold a provisional statement in respect of the premises? yes ! No X
lf the answer is "yes", please give the unique reference number for the provisional statement (as
set out at the top of the first page of the statement):

Regional Casino I
Bingo I
Betting (Track) !

Small Casino I
Fam ily Enterlainment Centre

Large Casino I
Adult Gaming Centre !
Betting (Other) [
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lf you are an individual, please fill in Section A. lf the application is being made
organisation (such as a company or partnership), please fill in section t, 

,,,,
1.,'1......r.,,:

Section A
lndividual applicant

1. Title: Mr E Mrs n Miss fl Ms n Dr n Other (ptease specify)

Él i' ,. , . ,r .,r, r ii,i
i..i '.' : i.. . -ì :: l liJ

..:.,,t ..,ì i

2. Surname: Other name(s):

[Use the names given in the applicant's operating licence or, if the appticant does not hotd an
operating licence, as given in any application for an operating licencel

3. Applicant's address (home or business * [delete as appropriate]):

Postcode:

a The number of the applicant's licence (as set out in the ratin licence

on behalf of an

20035990
Text Box
Appendix 1
Application Form



4(b) lf the applicant does not hold an operating licence but is in the process of applying for one,give the date on which the application was made:

5. Tick the box if the application is being made by more than one person. I
[where there are further applicants, the information required in questions 1 to 4 should be inctudedon additional sheefs attached to this form, and fhose sheefs should øe catearty marked ,,Details offurther applicants".l

Section B

Application on behalf of an organisation

6' Name of applicant business or organisation: Done Brothers (cash Betting) Limited T/A Betfred
[Use the names given in the applicant's operating licence or, if the applicant does not hotd anoperating licence, as given in any apptication foian operating ticence.¡
7. The applicant's registered or principal address:
Spectrum

56-58 Benson Road
Birchwood

Warrington

Postcode: WA3 7PQ

8(a) The number of the applicant's operating licence (as given in the operating licence):
000-001 058-N-1 02469_001

8(b) lf the applicant does not hold an operating licence but is in the process of applying for one,give the date on which the application was made:

9. Tick the box if the application is being made by more than one organisation. !
[Where there are furfher applicants, the information required in questions 6 fo B should be inctuded

should be clearly marked ,,Details of
on additional sheefs attached to this form and fhose sheefs
further fs".

posed trading name to be used at the premises (if known): BETFRED

1 1' Address of the premises (or, if none, give a description of the premises and their location)
86C Queen Street
Morley

Leeds

Postcode: LS27 gBP

10. Pro



12. Telephone number at premises (if known): NOT KNOWN

13. lf the premises are in only a part of a building, please describe the nature of the building (for
example, a shopping centre or office block). The description should include the number ofÍôors
within the building and the floor(s) on which the premises are located.
The premises are a ground floor unit, being part of a two storey building. The
application is to provide ground floor betting facilities, the upper floors are no part
of this application.
14(a) Are the premises situated in more than one licensing authority area?
No /delefe as appropriatel

14(b). lf the answer to question 14(a) is yes, please give the names of all the licensing authorities
within whose area the premises are partly located, other than the licensing authorii-y to which
this application is made:

nsing authority to exclude a default condition so that the premises may
than would othen¡rise be the case?

/No /delefe as appropriatel [Where the relevant kind of premises licenceis nof subject to any
default conditions, the answer to this question witt be no.l
15(b). lf the answer to question 15(a) is yes, please complete the table below to indicate the times
when you want the premises to be available for use under the premises licence.

15(a). Do you want the lice
be used for longer periods

Sfarf Finish Details of seasona/ variation
Mon hh:mm hh:mm

Tue

Wed

Thurs

Fri

Sat

Sun

16' lf you wish to apply for a premises licence with a condition restricting gambling to specific
periods in a year, please state the periods below using calendar dates:
N/A
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17. Proposed commencement date for licence (lea
soon as it is issued): (dd/mm/yyyy)

ve blank if you want the licence to commence as

19(")' Does the application relate to premise_s which are part of a track or other sporting venuewhich already has a premises licence? No /delefe as aþpropriatel
18(b)' lf the answer to question 18(a) is yes, please confirm by ticking the box that an application tovary the main track premises licence has been submitted with this ap-plicatron. ¡ 

- ' srrrrvs'.rvr ' !r

19(a)' Do you hold any other premises licences that have been issued by this licensing authority?
Yes [delete as appropriate]
19(b). If the answer to question 1g(a) is yes, please provide full details:
Please see attached.

20' Please set out any other matters which you consider to be relevant to your application
Please see attached.

l/ we confirm that the applicant(s) have the right to occupy the premises.
Checklist:

' Payment of the appropriate fee has been made/is enclosed
* A plan of the premises is enclosed
o l/ we understand that if the above requirements are not complied with the

application may be rejected

X

X

X

X
X

6 WEv nderstau dn that ISit OWn neces to adverti thSC esary tca on and VEappl g
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21. Signature
of the applica

of applicant or applicant's solicitor or other duly authorised agent. lf signing on behalf
nt, please state in what capacity:

ature

22' For joint applications, signature of 2nd applicant, or 2nd applicant's solicitor or other authorised
agent. lf signing on behalf of the applicant, please state in what capacity:

Ca Head of Develo ment

Stuart Divitt

0810212018

nature:

Print Name:

Date:

[Where there are more than two applicanfs, p/ease use an additionatsheef clearty marked
"Signature(s) of further applicant(s)". The sheef shoutd include all the information requested in
paragraphs 21 and 22.1

Capacity:

generatedthe to/s submittedbe anin[Where application electronic the shouldform, besignature
and beshould a of the written,s

Print Name:

Date:

23(a) Please give the name of a person who can be contacted about the application

23(b) Please give one or more telephone numbers at which the person identified in question 23(a)
can be contacted:

01925 2BB 592

24. Postal address for correspondence associated with this application:
Development Dept.

Betfred

Spectrum

56-58 Benson Road

Birchwood, Warrington

Postcode:WA3 7PQ
25. lf you are happy for correspondence in relation to your application to be sent via e-mail, please
give the e-mail address to which you would like correspondence to be sent:

Stuart Divítt

stuart.d com



PART 5 _ MISCELLANEOUS

Continued....

86C Queen Street, Morley, Leeds, LS27 9BP
Application for Betting Premises Licence

19 (b) lf the answerto question 19(a) is yes, please provide fulldetails

14 Market Place, Wetherby, Yorkshire, LS22 6NE

2871289 Harehills Lane, Harehills, Leeds, LSg 6AA

29al29b Harehills Rd, Harehills, Leeds, LS8 5HR

unit 7, Phase 1, Morrisons Development, I Jail Yard Parade, Rothwell, LS26 gAF

48 Town St, Armley, Leeds. LS12 3AA

79/81 Vicar Lane, Leeds, LS1 6QA

66 Street Lane, Leeds, LSB 2DQ

79 High St, Yeadon, Leeds, LS19 7SP

37a & 37b Town St, Horsforth, Leeds, LS18 sLJ

9 Church Lane, Pudsey, Leeds, LS2B 7LD

12 Swarcliffe Parade, Leeds, LS14 sAQ

2 Middleton Park Circus, Middleton, LS10 4LU

76 Harehills Road, Harehills, Leeds, LS8 sNU

61 Top MoorSide, Holbeck, Leeds, LS11 gLH

1644 Town Street, Stanningley, Pudsey, LS28 6ER

94 Harrogate Road, Leeds, LS7 4LZ

10 Bond St, Leeds, LS1 5EY

26 Austhorpe Road, Leeds, LS15 BDX

364 Lands Lane, Leeds, LS1 6LB

41 Vicar Lane, Leeds, LS1 6DS

Unit B Middleton District Centre, Middleton, Leeds, LS10 4AX




